
Company : Sol Infotech Pvt. Ltd.
Website : www.courtkutchehry.com

Karnataka Sales Tax (Amendment) Act, 2003

30 of 2003

[20 August 2003]

CONTENTS

1. Short Title And Commencement
2. Amendment Of Section 5
3. Insertion Of New Section 6-C
4. Amendment Of Section 18
5. Amendment Of Second Schedule
6. Amendment Of Sixth Schedule
7. Amendment Of Seventh Schedule
8. Repeal And Savings

Karnataka Sales Tax (Amendment) Act, 2003

30 of 2003

[20 August 2003]

An Act further to amend the Karnataka Sales Tax Act, 1957.
Whereas it is expedient further to amend the Karnataka Sales Tax
Act, 1957 (Karnataka Act 25 of 1957) for the purposes hereinafter
appearing; Be it enacted by the Karnataka State Legislature in the
fifty fourth year of the Republic of India, as follows:-

1. Short Title And Commencement :-

(1) This Act may be called the Karnataka Sales Tax (Amendment)
Act, 2003.
(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force with effect from the
First day of June, 2003.

2. Amendment Of Section 5 :-

In section 5 of the Karnataka Sales Tax Act, 1957 (Karnataka Act
25 of 1957) (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act), in sub-
section (1), for the words "twelve per cent", the words "thirteen per
cent" shall be substituted.

3. Insertion Of New Section 6-C :-



After section 6-B of the principal Act, the following shall be
inserted, namely.-
" 6-C. Levy of additional tax.-
Every registered dealer and every dealer who is liable to get
himself registered under sub-sections (1) and (2) of section 10
whose total turnover in a year is not less than the turnovers
specified in the said sub-sections, shall be liable to pay tax at the
rate of one per cent of such portion of the total turnover which is
liable to tax under section 5, 5-B, 5-C or 6.
Provided that no tax under this section shall be payable on that
part of such turnover which relates to,-
(i) sale or purchase of goods specified in the Fifth Schedule;
(ii) sale or purchase of goods in the course of interstate trade or
commerce;
(iii) sale or purchase of goods in the course of export out of the
territory of India or sale or purchase in the course of import into
the territory of India;
(iv) all amounts collected by way of tax under the provisions of this
Act or the Central Sales Tax Act, 1956 (Central Act 74 of 1956);
(v) all amounts falling under the head Freight, when specified and
charged for by the dealer separately without including such
amounts in the price of the goods sold;
(vi) all amounts allowed as discount, provided that such discount is
allowed in accordance with the regular practice of the dealer or is in
accordance with the terms of a contract or agreement entered into
a particular case and provided also that the accounts show that the
purchaser has paid only the sum originally charged less discount;
(vii) (a) all amounts allowed to purchaser in respect of goods
returned by them to the dealer when the goods are taxable on
sales provided that the goods were returned within a period of six
months from the date of delivery of the goods and the accounts
show the date on which the goods were returned and the date on
which and the amount for which refund was made;
(b)all amounts received from the sellers in respect of goods
returned to them by the dealer, when the goods are taxable on the
purchase value provided that the goods were returned within a
period of six months from the date of delivery of the goods and the
accounts show the date on which the goods were returned and the
date on which and the amount for which refund was received;
(viii) such amounts towards labour charges and other like charges
not involving any transfer of property in goods, actually incurred in



connection with the execution of works contract, or calculated at
the rates prescribed;
(ix) all amounts realized by a dealer by the sale of his business as a
whole;
(x) the total amount paid or payable by the dealer as a
consideration for the purchase of any of the goods in respect of
which tax is leviable at the point of sale;
( x i ) the total amount paid or payable to the dealer as a
consideration for the sale of any of the goods in respect of which
tax is leviable at the point of purchase;
Provided further that, save as otherwise provided in this section, no
other deduction shall be made from the total turnover of a dealer
for the purposes of this Section.
(2) The provisions of this Act and the rules made thereunder shall,
so far as may be, apply in relation to the assessment, collection or
refund of the additional tax, as they apply in relation to the
assessment, collection or refund of tax under the other provisions
of this Act."

4. Amendment Of Section 18 :-

In section 18 of the principal Act, after sub-section (2), the
following shall be inserted, namely.-" (3) Notwithstanding anything
contained in sub-sections (1) and (2), no dealer who is liable to pay
additional tax under section 6-C shall collect any amount by way of
such additional tax or purporting to be by way of such additional
tax payable by him."

5. Amendment Of Second Schedule :-

In the Second Schedule to the principal Act,
(1) in Part A,
(a) in the entries relating to serial number 1, in column 3, for the
words "Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted;
(b) in the entries relating to serial number 2, in column 3, for the
words "Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(c) in serial number 5,
(i) in the entries relating to item (ii), in column 3, for the words
"Twelve per cent",
the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be substituted;
(ii) in the entries relating to item (iii), in column 3, for the words



"Twelve per cent",
the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be substituted;
(iii) in the entries relating to item (iv), in column 3, for the words
"Twelve per cent",
the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be substituted;
(iv) in the entries relating to item (v), in column 3, for the words
"Twelve per cent",
the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be substituted;
(v) in the entries relating to item (vi), in column 3, for the words
"Twelve per cent",
the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be substituted;
(vi) in the entries relating to item (vii), in column 3, for the words
"Twelve per cent",
the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be substituted.
(d) in the entries relating to serial number 5-A, in column 3, for the
word s "Four per cent", the words "Five per cent" shall be
substituted.
(e) in the entries relating to serial number 7, in column 3, for the
words "Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(2) in Part B,
(a) in the entries relating to serial number 2, in column 3, for the
words "Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(b) in the entries relating to serial number 4, in column 3, for the
words "Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(c) in serial number 8,
(i) in the entries relating to item (i), in column 3, for the words
"Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted;
(ii) in the entries relating to item (iii), in column 3, for the words
"Twelve per cent",
the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be substituted.
(d) in serial number 9, in column 3, for the words "Four percent",
the words "Five per cent" shall be substituted.
(e ) in serial number 10, in the entries relating to item (ii), in
column 3, for the words
"Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(f) in the entries relating to serial number 12, in column 3, for the
words "Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be



substituted.
(3) in Part C,
(a) in the entries relating to serial number 1, in column 3, for the
words "Four per cent", the words "Five per cent" shall be
substituted.
(b) in serial number 4, in the entries relating to item (ii), in column
3, for the words
"Four per cent", the words "Five per cent" shall be substituted.
(c) in the entries relating to serial number 5,
(i) in item (i), in column 3, for the words "Fifteen per cent", the
words "Sixteen per cent" shall be substituted;
(ii) in item (ii), in sub-item (a)in column 3, for the words "Twelve
per cent", the words
"Thirteen per cent" shall be substituted;
(iii) in item (ii), in sub-item (b)in column 3, for the words "Twelve
per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be substituted;
(iv) in item (ii), in sub-item (c)in column 3, for the words "Twelve
per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be substituted;
(v) in item (ii), in sub-item (d)in column 3, for the words "Twelve
per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be substituted;
(vi)in item (iii), in column 3, for the words "Twelve per cent", the
words "Thirteen per cent" shall be substituted.
(d) in serial number 7, in the entries relating to item (ii), in column
3, for the words
"Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(e) in the entries relating to serial number 8-A, in column 3, for the
words "Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(f) in the entries relating to serial number 9, in column 3, for the
words "Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(g) in the entries relating to serial number 13, in column 3, for the
words "Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(h) in the entries relating to serial number 14, in column 3, for the
words "Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(i) in the entries relating to serial number 15, in column 3, for the
words "Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(j) in the entries relating to serial number 15-A, in column 3, for



the words "Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(k) in the entries relating to serial number 16, in column 3, for the
words "Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(l) in serial number 18, in the entries relating to item (iii), in
column 3, for the words
"F if teen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(m) in the entries relating to serial number 19,
(i) in item (i), in column 3, for the words "Four per cent", the words
"Five per cent"
shall be substituted;
(ii) in item (ii), in column 3, for the words "Twelve per cent", the
words "Thirteen per cent" shall be substituted.
(n) in serial number 20,
(i) in the entries relating to item (i), in column 3, for the words
"Four per cent", the words "Five per cent" shall be substituted;
(ii) in the entries relating to item (ii), in column 3, for the words
"Four per cent", the words "Five per cent" shall be substituted;
(iii) in the entries relating to item (iii), in column 3, for the words
"Four per cent", the words "Five per cent" shall be substituted;
(iv) in the entries relating to item (iv), in column 3, for the words
"Four per cent", the words "Five per cent" shall be substituted;
(v) in the entries relating to item (v), in column 3, for the words
"Four per cent", the words "Five per cent" shall be substituted.
(o) in serial number 21,
(i) in the entries relating to item (i), in column 3, for the words
"Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted;
(ii) in the entries relating to item (ii), in column 3, for the words
"Fifteen per cent",
the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be substituted.
(p) in serial number 23,
(i) in the entries relating to item (i), in column 3, for the words
"Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted;
(ii) in the entries relating to item (iv), in column 3, for the words
"Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(q) in the entries relating to serial number 25, in column 3, for the
word s "Four per cent", the words "Five per cent" shall be



substituted.
(r) in the entries relating to serial number 25-A, in column 3, for
t h e words "Four per cent", the words "Five per cent" shall be
substituted.
(s) in the entries relating to serial number 25-B, in column 3, for
the words "Four per cent", the words "Five per cent" shall be
substituted.
(t) in serial number 26,
(i) in the entries relating to item (i), in column 3, for the words
"Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted;
(ii) in the entries relating to item (ii), in column 3, for the words
"Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(4) in Part D,
(a) in serial number 1, in Column (3) for the words "Twelve per
cent ", the words " Thirteen per cent " shall be substituted.
(b) in serial number 2, in Column (3) for the words "Twelve per
cent ", the words "Thirteen per cent " shall be substituted.
(c) in serial number 3, in Column (3) for the words "Twelve per
cent ", the words " Thirteen per cent " shall be substituted
(d) in serial number 4, in Column (3) for the words " Fifteen per
cent ", the words " Sixteen per cent " shall be substituted.
(e) in serial number 6, in Column (3) for the words "Twelve per
cent ", the words " Thirteen per cent " shall be substituted.
(5) in Part E,
(a) in serial number 1,
(i) in the entries relating to item (i), in column 3, for the words
"Four per cent",
the words "Five per cent" shall be substituted;
(ii) in the entries relating to item (ii), in column 3, for the words
"Four per cent",
the words "Five per cent" shall be substituted;
(iii) in the entries relating to item (iii), in column 3, for the words
"Four per cent",
the words "Five per cent" shall be substituted.
(b) serial number 2,
(i) in the entries relating to item (i), in column 3, for the words
"Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted;
(ii) in the entries relating to item (ii), in column 3, for the words
"Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be



substituted;
(iii) in the entries relating to item (iii), in column 3, for the words
"Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted;
(iv) in the entries relating to item (iv), in column 3, for the words
"Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted;
(v) in the entries relating to item (v), in column 3, for the words
"F if teen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted;
(vi) in the entries relating to item (vi), in column 3, for the words
"Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(c) in the entries relating to serial number 3, in column 3, for the
words "Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(d) in the entries relating to serial number 4, in column 3, for the
words "Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(6) in Part F,
(a) in the entries relating to serial number 1, in column 3, for the
words "Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(b) in serial number 2,
(i) in the entries relating to item (i), in column 3, for the words
"Eight per cent", the words "Nine per cent" shall be substituted;
(ii) in the entries relating to item (ii), in column 3, for the words
"Eight per cent", the words "Nine per cent" shall be substituted;
(iii) in the entries relating to item (iii), in column 3, for the words
"Eight per cent", the words "Nine per cent" shall be substituted.
(c) in the entries relating to serial number 3, in column 3, for the
words "Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(d) in the entries relating to serial number 5, in column 3, for the
words "Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(e) in the entries relating to serial number 6, in column 3, for the
words "Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(f) in serial number 7, in the entries relating to item (i), in column
3, for the words "Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent"
shall be substituted.



(g) in serial number 8,
(i) in the entries relating to item (i), in column 3, for the words
"Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted;
(ii) in the entries relating to item (ii), in column 3, for the words
"Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted;
(iii) in the entries relating to item (iii), in column 3, for the words
"Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted;
(iv) in the entries relating to item (iv), in column 3, for the words
"Twelve per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted;
(v) in item (v), in the entries relating to in sub-item (a), in column
3, for the words "Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent"
shall be substituted;
(vi) in the entries relating to in item (vi), in column 3, for the
words "Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted;
(vii) in the entries relating to in item (vii), in column 3, for the
words "Eight per cent", the words "Nine per cent" shall be
substituted.
(h) in the entries relating to serial number 9, in column 3, for the
words "Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(i) in the entries relating to serial number 10, in column 3, for the
words "Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(j) in the entries relating to serial number 11, in column 3, for the
words "Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(k) in the entries relating to serial number 11-A, in column 3, for
the words "Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(l) in serial number 12,
(i) in the entries relating to item (i), in column 3, for the words
"Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted;
(ii) in the entries relating to item (ii), in column 3, for the words
"Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(m) in the entries relating to serial number 13, in column 3, for the



words "Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(n) in the entries relating to serial number 14, in column 3, for the
words "Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(7) in Part G,
(a) in the entries relating to serial number 1, in column 3, for the
words "Eight per cent", the words "Nine per cent" shall be
substituted.
(b) in the entries relating to serial number 2, in column 3, for the
words "Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(c) in the entries relating to serial number 3, in column 3, for the
words "Eight per cent", the words "Nine per cent" shall be
substituted.
(d) in the entries relating to serial number 4, in column 3, for the
word s "Four per cent", the words "Five per cent" shall be
substituted.
(e) in the entries relating to serial number 4-A, in column 3, for the
words "Four per cent", the words "Five per cent" shall be
substituted.
(f) in the entries relating to serial number 5, in column 3, for the
words "Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(g) in the entries relating to serial number 6, in column 3, for the
words "Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(8) in Part "H",
(a) in serial number 1,
(i) in the entries relating to item (i), in column 3, for the words
"Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted;
(ii) in the entries relating to item (ii), in column 3, for the words
"Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted;
(iii) in the entries relating to item (iii), in column 3, for the words
"Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted;
(iv) in the entries relating to item (iv), in column 3, for the words
"Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(b) in the entries relating to serial number 1-A, in column 3, for the



words "Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(c) in the entries relating to serial number 2, in column 3, for the
words "Eight per cent", the words "Nine per cent" shall be
substituted.
(d) in the entries relating to serial number 3, in column 3, for the
words "Four per cent", the words "Five per cent" shall be
substituted.
(9) in Part I,
(a) in the entries relating to serial number 1, in column 3, for the
words "Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(b) in the entries relating to serial number 3, in column 3, for the
words "Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(c) in the entries relating to serial number 4, in column 3, for the
words "Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(d) in serial number 6,
(i) in the entries relating to item (i), in column 3, for the words
"Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted;
(ii) in the entries relating to item (ii), in column 3, for the words
"Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(10) in Part-J,
(a) in Serial Number 2, in Column 3 for the words " Two per cent ",
the words "Four per cent " shall be substituted.
(b) in Serial Number 3, in Column 3 for the words " Twelve per cent
", the words " Thirteen per cent " shall be substituted.
(11) in Part K,
(a) in the entries relating to serial number 1, in column 3, for the
words "Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(b) in serial number 1-A,
(i) in the entries relating to item (iii), in column 3, for the words
"Eight per cent", the words "Nine per cent" shall be substituted;
(ii) in the entries relating to item (iv), in column 3, for the words
"Four per cent", the words "Five per cent" shall be substituted.
(c) in the entries relating to serial number 2, in column 3, for the
words "Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted.



(d) in the entries relating to serial number 3, in column 3, for the
words "Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(12) in Part L
(a) in the entries relating to serial number 1, in column 3, for the
words "Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(b) in the entries relating to serial number 3, in column 3, for the
words "Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(c) in the entries relating to serial number 4, in column 3, for the
words "Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(d) in the entries relating to serial number 5, in column 3, for the
word s "Four per cent", the words "Five per cent" shall be
substituted.
(e) in the entries relating to Serial Number 7, in column 3, for the
words "Twenty per cent", the words " Twenty five per cent " shall
be substituted.
(13) in Part M
(a) in serial number 1,
(i) in item (i), in the entries relating to sub-item (a), in column 3,
for the words "Eight per cent", the words "Nine per cent" shall be
substituted;
(ii) in item (i), in the entries relating to sub-item (b), in column 3,
for the words
"Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted;
(iii) in item (iii), in the entries relating to sub-item (a), in column 3,
for the words "Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall
be substituted;
(iv) in item (iii), in the entries relating to sub-item (c), in column 3,
for the words
"Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted;
(v) in item (iii), in the entries relating to sub-item (d), in column 3,
for the words
"Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted;
(vi) in item (iii), in the entries relating to sub-item (e), in column 3,
for the words
"Eight per cent", the words "Nine per cent" shall be substituted.



(b) in the entries relating to serial number 5, in column 3, for the
words "Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(c) in the entries relating to serial number 6, in column 3, for the
words "Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(d) in the entries relating to serial number 9, in column 3, for the
words "Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(e) in the entries relating to serial number 11, in column 3, for the
words "Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(f) in serial number 15, in the entries relating to item (ii), in
column 3, for the words
"Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(14) in Part N, in the entries relating to serial number 2, in column
3, for the words "Eight per cent", the words "Nine per cent" shall be
substituted.
(15) in Part O, in serial number 3,
(a) in the entries relating to item (i), in column 3, for the words
"Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(b) in the entries relating to item (ii), in column 3, for the words
"Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(c) in the entries relating to item (iii), in column 3, for the words
"Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(16) in Part P,
(a) in serial number 1,
( i) in the entries relating to item (i), in column 3, for the words
"Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted;
(ii) in the entries relating to item (ii), in column 3, for the words
"Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(b) in the entries relating to serial number 3, in column 3, for the
words "Eight per cent", the words "Nine per cent" shall be
substituted.
(c) in the entries relating to serial number 4, in column 3, for the
words "Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be



substituted.
(d) in serial number 5,
(i) in the entries relating to item (i), in column 3, for the words
"Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted;
(ii) in the entries relating to item (ii), in column 3, for the words
"Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(e) in the entries relating to serial number 6, in column 3, for the
words "Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(f) in serial number 7,
(i) in the entries relating to item (ii), in column 3, for the words
"Four per cent", the words "Five per cent" shall be substituted;
(ii) in the entries relating to item (iii), in column 3, for the words
"Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(g) in the entries relating to serial number 8, in column 3, for the
words "Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(h) in the entries relating to serial number 9, in column 3, for the
words "Two per cent", the words "Four per cent" shall be
substituted.
(i) in the entries relating to serial number 10, in column 3, for the
words "Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(j) in the entries relating to serial number 11, in column 3, for the
words "Eight per cent", the words "Nine per cent" shall be
substituted.
(k) in serial number 12,
(i)in the entries relating to item (ii), in column 3, for the words
"Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted;
(ii) in the entries relating to item (iii), in column 3, for the words
"Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(17) in Part R,
(a) in the entries relating to serial number 2, in column 3, for the
words "Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(b) in the entries relating to serial number 4, in column 3, for the
words "Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be



substituted.
(c) in the entries relating to serial number 8, in column 3, for the
words "Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(d) in serial number 9,
( i) in the entries relating to item (i), in column 3, for the words
"Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted;
(ii) in the entries relating to item (ii), in column 3, for the words
"Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(e) in serial number 10,
(i) in the entries relating to item (i), in column 3, for the words
"Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted;
(ii) in the entries relating to item (ii), in column 3, for the words
"Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted;
(iii) in the entries relating to item (iii), in column 3, for the words
"Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted;
(iv) in the entries relating to item (iv), in column 3, for the words
"Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted;
(v) in the entries relating to item (v), in column 3, for the words
"Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(f) in the entries relating to serial number 11, in column 3, for the
words "Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(18) in Part S,
(a) in the entries relating to serial number 3, in column 3, for the
words "Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(b) in the entries relating to serial number 4, in column 3, for the
words "Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(c) in the entries relating to serial number 5, in column 3, for the
words "Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(d) in the entries relating to serial number 6, in column 3, for the
words "Four per cent ", the words "Five per cent" shall be



substituted.
(e) in the entries relating to serial number 7, in column 3, for the
words "Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(f) in serial number 9,
(i) in the entries relating to item (i), in column 3, for the words
"Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted;
(ii) in the entries relating to item (ii), in column 3, for the words
"Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted;
(iii) in the entries relating to item (iii), in column 3, for the words
"Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted;
(iv) in the entries relating to item (iv), in column 3, for the words
"Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(g) in the entries relating to serial number 10, in column 3, for the
words "Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(h) in the entries relating to serial number 13, in column 3, for the
words "Four per cent", the words "Five per cent" shall be
substituted.
(i) in serial number 15,
(i) in the entries relating to item (i), in column 3, for the words
"Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted;
(ii) in the entries relating to item (i-a), in column 3, for the words
"Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted;
(iii) in the entries relating to item (ii), in column 3, for the words
"Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted;
(iv) in the entries relating to item (ii-a), in column 3, for the words
"Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(j) in the entries relating to serial number 15-A, in column 3, for
the words "Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(k) in the entries relating to serial number 18, in column 3, for the
words "Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted.



(l) in the entries relating to serial number 18-B, in column 3, for
the words "Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(m) in the entries relating to serial number 19, in column 3, for the
words "Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(n) in the entries relating to serial number 21, in column 3, for the
words "Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(o)in the entries relating to serial number 22, in column 3, for the
words "Eight per cent", the words "Nine per cent" shall be
substituted.
(p) in the entries relating to serial number 23, in column 3, for the
words, "Twelve percent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(q) in the entries relating to serial number 24, in column 3, for the
words "Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(19) in Part T,
(a) in the entries relating to serial number 1, in column 3, for the
words "Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(b) in the entries relating to serial number 1-A, in column 3, for the
words "Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(c) in the entries relating to serial number 2, in column 3, for the
words "Four per cent", the words "Five per cent" shall be
substituted.
(d) in the entries relating to serial number 3, in column 3, for the
words "Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(e)in serial number 5,
(i) in the entries relating to item (i), in column 3, for the words
"Fifteen cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be substituted;
(ii) in the entries relating to item (ii), in column 3, for the words
"Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(f) in the entries relating to serial number 6-A, in column 3, for the
words "Fifteen per cent", the words " Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(g) in the entries relating to serial number 7, in column 3, for the
words "Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be



substituted.
(h) in the entries relating to serial number 7-A, in column 3, for the
words "Eight per cent", the words " Nine per cent" shall be
substituted.
(i) in the entries relating to serial number 7-B, in column 3, for the
words "Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(j) in serial number 8,
(i) in the entries relating to item (i), in column 3, for the words
"Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted;
(ii) in the entries relating to item (ii), in column 3, for the words
"Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted;
(iii) in the entries relating to item (iii), in column 3, for the words
"Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted;
(iv) in the entries relating to item (iv), in column 3, for the words
"F if teen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted;
(v) in the entries relating to item (v), in column 3, for the words
"Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(k) in the entries relating to serial number 9-B, in column 3, for the
words "Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(l) in the entries relating to serial number 10-A, in column 3, for
the words "Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(m) in serial number 10-B,
(i) in the entries relating to item (i), in column 3, for the words
"Eight per cent", the words "Nine per cent" shall be substituted;
(ii) in the entries relating to item (ii), in column 3, for the words
"Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(n) in serial number 11, in the entries relating to item (i), in
column 3, for the words
"Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(20) in Part V,
(a) in the entries relating to serial number 1, in column 3, for the
words "Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be



substituted.
(b) in the entries relating to serial number 2, in column 3, for the
words "Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(21) in Part W,
(a) in the entries relating to serial number 3, in column 3, for the
words "Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(b) in the entries relating to serial number 4, in column 3, for the
words "Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(c) in the entries relating to serial number 4-A, in column 3, for the
words "Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(d) in the entries relating to serial number 5, in column 3, for the
words "Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(e) in serial number 6,
(i) in the entries relating to item (i), in column 3, for the words
"Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted;
(ii) in the entries relating to item (ii), in column 3, for the words
"Fifteen per cent", the words "Sixteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(f) in the entries relating to serial number 7, in column 3, for the
words "Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(g) in the entries relating to serial number 8, in column 3, for the
words "Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent" shall be
substituted.
(22) in Part X,in the entries relating to serial number 1, in column
3, for the words "Twelve per cent", the words "Thirteen per cent"
shall be substituted.
(23) in Part Y,in the entries relating to serial number 1, in column
3, for the words "Eight per cent", the words "Nine per cent" shall be
substituted.
(24) in Part Z,in the entries relating to serial number 1, in column
3, for the words "Four per cent", the words "Five per cent" shall be
substituted.

6. Amendment Of Sixth Schedule :-



In Sixth Schedule to the principal Act, in column 3,
(i) excluding the entries relating to item (ii) of serial number 20, for
the words "Four per cent", wherever they occur, the words "Five
per cent" shall be substituted.
( i i ) for the words "Twelve per cent", wherever they occur, the
words "Thirteen per cent" shall be substituted.

7. Amendment Of Seventh Schedule :-

In Seventh Schedule to the principal Act, in column 3, for the
words "Four per cent", wherever they occur, the words "Five per
cent" shall be substituted.

8. Repeal And Savings :-

(1) The Karnataka Sales Tax (Amendment) Ordinance, 2003
(Karnataka Ordinance No.1 of 2003) is hereby repealed.
(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken
under the principal Act, as amended by the said Ordinance shall be
deemed to have been done or taken under the principal Act, as
amended by this Act.


